

Salt and De-icing Materials Bid 22-39																				
Bid Opening: October 20, 2022																				
	Est. Qty	Safe Step Ice Melt 570 (50# BOX)			Est. Qty	Safe Step Ice Melt 570 (50# BAG)			Est. Qty	Morton Saf-T-Salt (50# BAG)			Est. Qty	All Purpose Sand			Est. Qty	Bulk Rock Salt (per TON)		
	384	Unit Price	Total Price	Notations	392	Unit Price	Total Price	Notations	392	Unit Price	Total Price	Notations	49	Unit Price	Total Price	Notations	240	Cost per Ton	Total Price	Notations
BRITTON INDUSTRIES		No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid			\$111.95	\$26,868.00	Cost does not include wait time fees if held at port- delivery included.
CARGILL, INC.		No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid			\$93.47	\$22,432.80	
DAVIS FEED MILL		No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid			\$5.90	\$2,312.80			\$5.65	\$276.85			\$85.00	\$20,400.00	
EASTERN SALT COMPANY INC.		No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid			\$89.00	\$21,360.00	
GOVERNMENT MLO SUPPLIES		\$21.30	\$8,179.20	Emperor Melt		\$10.35	\$4,057.20	Emperor Melt		\$8.50	\$3,332.00	Rock Salt		No Bid	No Bid			\$89.00	\$21,360.00	
KUHNSVILLE ASPHALT PRODUCTS		\$15.25	\$5,856.00	40 Per Pallet		\$13.70	\$5,370.40			\$9.94	\$3,896.48			No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	
RIVERSIDE CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS, INC.		No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid			\$80.00	\$19,200.00	
SITEONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY, LLC.		\$9.25	\$3,552.00	#510500 LESCO MELT #50lbs.		\$9.25	\$3,626.00	#510500 LESCO MELT #50lbs.		\$6.69	\$2,622.48	#191214 Kissner 50 lbs.; Ice Patrol Rock Salt		No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	

Bid History	2019-2020	2020-2021	2021-2022	2022-2023
Safe Step Ice Melt 570 (50# BOX)	N/A	\$7.20	No Award	No Award
Safe Step Ice Melt 570 (50# BAG)	N/A	\$7.20	\$7.45	\$9.25
Morton Saf-T Salt (50# BAG)	\$5.00	\$5.00	\$5.20	\$5.90
Bulk Rock Salt (Per TON)	\$57.89	\$55.83	\$70.00	\$80.00
All-Purpose Sand (50# BAG)	\$4.50	\$4.50	\$5.20	\$5.65