

**COUNCIL ROCK SCHOOL DISTRICT**  
**LIQUID PROPANE GAS (LPG) COMMODITY & DELIVERY SERVICES BID #18-38**  
**BID DUE DATE: May 23, 2018**

| BIDDER:                                      |                   | Rhoads Energy         |                              |                            | Sharp Energy          |                              |                | Suburban Propane                                       |                              |                     | Wilson of Wallingford |                              |                |
|--|-------------------|-----------------------|------------------------------|----------------------------|-----------------------|------------------------------|----------------|--|------------------------------|---------------------|-----------------------|------------------------------|----------------|
| FIXED FOR 12 MONTHS:                         |                   | COST/GALLON-<br>FIXED |                              |                            | COST/GALLON-<br>FIXED |                              |                | COST/GALLON-<br>FIXED                                  |                              |                     | COST/GALLON-<br>FIXED |                              |                |
| 2018-2019                                    |                   | \$ 1.21               |                              |                            | \$ 1.15               |                              |                | \$ 1.31  |                              |                     | \$ 1.33               |                              |                |
| 2019-2020                                    |                   | \$ 1.14               |                              |                            | \$ 1.04               |                              |                | \$ 1.39  |                              |                     | \$ 1.26               |                              |                |
| 2020-2021                                    |                   | \$ 1.28               |                              |                            | \$ 1.03               |                              |                | No Bid   |                              | Bid prior to 3rd yr | \$ 1.25               |                              |                |
| FIXED FOR DEC/JAN/FEB.:                      |                   | COST/GALLON-<br>FIXED | COST/GALLON-<br>DIFFERENTIAL |                            | COST/GALLON-<br>FIXED | COST/GALLON-<br>DIFFERENTIAL |                | COST/GALLON-<br>FIXED                                  | COST/GALLON-<br>DIFFERENTIAL |                     | COST/GALLON-<br>FIXED | COST/GALLON-<br>DIFFERENTIAL |                |
| 2018-2019                                    |                   | \$ 1.30               | \$ 0.32                      | Mt. B                      | \$ 1.23               | \$ 0.28                      | OPIS           | \$ 1.44  | \$ 0.55                      | Mt. B               |                       |                              |                |
| 2019-2020                                    |                   | \$ 1.20               | \$ 0.33                      | Mt. B                      | \$ 1.11               | \$ 0.30                      | OPIS           | \$ 1.48  | \$ 0.55                      | Mt. B               |                       |                              |                |
| 2020-2021                                    |                   | \$ 1.20               | \$ 0.33                      | Mt. B                      | \$ 1.11               | \$ 0.30                      | OPIS           | No Bid   |                              | Bid prior to 3rd yr |                       |                              |                |
| FIXED- 3 GROUPINGS:                          |                   | COST/GALLON-<br>FIXED |                              |                            | COST/GALLON-<br>FIXED |                              |                | COST/GALLON-<br>FIXED                                  |                              |                     | COST/GALLON-<br>FIXED |                              |                |
| 2018-2019                                    | DEC/JAN/FEB       | \$ 1.30               |                              |                            | \$ 1.23               |                              |                | \$ 1.44  |                              |                     |                       |                              |                |
|  | OCT/NOV/MAR/APR   | \$ 1.23               |                              |                            | \$ 1.14               |                              |                | \$ 1.31  |                              |                     |                       |                              |                |
|  | MAY/JUNE/AUG/SEPT | \$ 1.11               |                              |                            | \$ 1.11               |                              |                | \$ 1.31  |                              |                     |                       |                              |                |
| 2019-2020                                    | DEC/JAN/FEB       | \$ 1.20               |                              |                            | \$ 1.11               |                              |                | \$ 1.48  |                              |                     |                       |                              |                |
|  | OCT/NOV/MAR/APR   | \$ 1.15               |                              |                            | \$ 1.04               |                              |                | \$ 1.39  |                              |                     |                       |                              |                |
|  | MAY/JUNE/AUG/SEPT | \$ 1.06               |                              |                            | \$ 0.97               |                              |                | \$ 1.39  |                              |                     |                       |                              |                |
| 2020-2021                                    | DEC/JAN/FEB       | \$ 1.20               |                              |                            | \$ 1.11               |                              |                | No Bid   |                              | Bid prior to 3rd yr |                       |                              |                |
|  | OCT/NOV/MAR/APR   | \$ 1.13               |                              |                            | \$ 1.04               |                              |                | No Bid   |                              | Bid prior to 3rd yr |                       |                              |                |
|  | MAY/JUNE/AUG/SEPT | \$ 1.04               |                              |                            | \$ 0.96               |                              |                | No Bid   |                              | Bid prior to 3rd yr |                       |                              |                |
| MAINTENANCE:                                 |                   | PER VISIT:            | PER HOUR:                    |                            | PER VISIT:            | PER HOUR:                    |                | PER VISIT:   | PER HOUR:                    |                     | PER VISIT:            | PER HOUR:                    |                |
| GENERAL                                      |                   | No Charge             | No Charge                    |                            |                       | \$ 125.00                    | Business hours | \$ -   | \$ 125.00                    | plus parts          |                       | \$ 80.00                     | point to point |
| FILTER REPLACEMENT                           |                   | \$ 368.14             | No Charge                    | Per location               |                       | \$ 950.00                    | Both locations | \$625.00 twice yearly                                  | \$ 125.00                    |                     |                       | \$ 120.00                    | plus parts     |
| EMERGENCY SERVICES                           |                   | \$ 150.00             | N/A                          | Flat fee                   |                       | \$ 125.00                    |                | if wet fuel, add \$0.175 to price of fuel for that day |                              |                     |                       | \$ 80.00                     | point to point |
| OTHER MAINTENANCE SERVICES:                  |                   | PER VISIT:            | PER HOUR:                    | PER GALL:                  | PER VISIT:            | PER HOUR:                    | PER GALL:      | PER VISIT:   | PER HOUR:                    | PER GALL:           | PER VISIT:            | PER HOUR:                    | PER GALL:      |
| Emergency Fueling                            |                   | \$ 150.00             | N/A                          | Per respective SY contract |                       | \$ 187.50                    |                |  |                              |                     | \$ 175.00             | \$ 80.00                     | 1.25/miles     |
| Continued limited 3 yr warranty on dispenser |                   | N/A                   | N/A                          | N/A                        |                       |                              |                |  |                              |                     |                       |                              | point to point |
| <b>* Alt pricing submitted</b>               |                   |                       |                              |                            |                       |                              |                |  |                              |                     |                       |                              |                |