

<b>COMPUTERS AND NUTANIX BID #21-34</b>														
<b>Bid Date: 6-3-2021</b>														
Softchoice – invalid bid format														
<b>Category 1 – 4000</b>			<b>Category 2 – 25</b>											
<b>VENDOR</b>	<b>Each</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>Each</b>	<b>Total</b>										
CMSC	\$263.00	\$1,052,000.00	NO BID		Did not meet specs (insufficient memory)									
ASK Tech	\$313.00	\$1,252,000.00	\$35.00	\$875.00	Did not meet bid spec – memory									
Connection (HPI Chromebook)	\$370.37	\$1,481,480.00	\$19.44	\$486.00	Unknown processor									
<b>CDW – MDRH149</b>	<b>\$422.04</b>	<b>\$1,688,160.00</b>	<b>\$28.50</b>	<b>\$712.50</b>										
ThinkSpaceIT	\$466.88	\$1,867,520.00	\$58.37	\$1,459.25										
Virtucom	\$495.00	\$1,980,000.00	\$20.00	\$500.00										
En-NetServices	\$516.70	\$2,066,800.00	\$16.66	\$416.50										
Mvation	\$575.34	\$2,301,360.00	\$43.84	\$1,096.00										
Integra1	\$614.49	\$2,457,960.00	\$22.50	\$562.50										
RTI	\$640.00	\$2,560,000.00	\$20.00	\$500.00										
Integra1	\$788.48	\$3,153,920.00	\$22.50	\$562.50										
Staples	\$930.47	\$3,721,880.00	\$17.19	\$429.75										
<b>Category 3A – Laptops (25)</b>			<b>Category 3B – Docking Station</b>			<b>Category 3B – Soundbar</b>			<b>Category 3B – Keyboard/Mouse</b>			<b>Category 3B – Monitor</b>		
<b>VENDOR</b>	<b>Each</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>Each</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>Each</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>Each</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>Each</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>Each</b>	<b>Total</b>		
Virtucom	\$961.00	\$24,025.00	\$188.00	\$4,700.00	\$29.00	\$725.00	\$18.00	\$450.00	\$138.00	\$3,450.00	\$33,350.00	Insufficient specs		
<b>En-NetServices</b>	<b>\$1,088.95</b>	<b>\$27,223.75</b>	<b>\$174.74</b>	<b>\$4,368.50</b>	<b>\$23.56</b>	<b>\$589.00</b>	<b>\$13.74</b>	<b>\$343.50</b>	<b>\$130.69</b>	<b>\$3,267.25</b>	<b>\$35,792.00</b>			
Staples	\$1,089.15	\$27,228.75	\$176.44	\$4,411.00	\$23.79	\$594.75	\$13.88	\$347.00	\$126.89	\$3,172.25	\$35,753.75			
Integra1	\$1,215.00	\$30,375.00	\$190.00	\$4,750.00	\$26.09	\$652.25	\$16.50	\$412.50	\$134.00	\$3,350.00	\$39,539.75			
Connection	\$1,171.30	\$29,282.50	\$217.33	\$5,433.25	\$25.52	\$638.00	\$15.75	\$393.75	\$165.97	\$4,149.25	\$39,896.75			
RTI	\$1,155.00	\$28,875.00	\$260.00	\$6,500.00	\$30.00	\$750.00	\$20.00	\$500.00	\$180.00	\$4,500.00	\$41,125.00			
ASK Tech	\$1,360.00	\$34,000.00	\$175.00	\$4,375.00	\$45.00	\$1,125.00	\$28.00	\$700.00	\$130.00	\$3,250.00	\$43,450.00			
Mvation	\$1,501.10	\$37,527.50	\$55.30	\$1,382.50	\$41.30	\$1,032.50	\$21.28	\$532.00	\$119.77	\$2,994.25	\$43,468.75			
ThinkSpaceIT	\$1,877.94	\$46,948.50	\$184.66	\$4,616.50	\$24.24	\$606.00	\$14.48	\$362.00	\$132.23	\$3,305.75	\$55,838.75			
CDW	\$1,248.00	\$31,200.00	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID			NO BID				
<b>Category 4</b>														
<b>VENDOR</b>	<b>Each</b>	<b>Total</b>												
Virtucom	\$578.00	\$428,876.00	Insufficient specs											
Staples	\$720.30	\$534,462.60	Rejected – past performance											
En-NetServices	\$743.28	\$551,513.76	Rejected – past performance											
Connection	\$786.32	\$583,449.44	Rejected – past performance											
RTI	\$825.00	\$612,150.00	Rejected – past performance											
Integra1	\$860.20	\$638,268.40	Rejected – past performance											
<b>ASK Tech</b>	<b>\$870.00</b>	<b>\$645,540.00</b>												
Mvation	\$1,067.24	\$791,892.08												
CDW	\$1,198.34	\$889,168.28												
ThinkSpaceIT	\$1,482.18	\$1,099,777.56												
<b>Category 5</b>														
<b>VENDOR</b>	<b>Total</b>													
<b>ASK Tech</b>	<b>\$508,000.00</b>													
vCloud	\$520,041.69													
Mvation	\$526,806.82													
SoftChoice	\$548,998.04													
High Availability	\$553,212.88 (Non Responsive)													
En-NetServices	INCOMPLETE BID													