
 

 

February 28, 2025 
 
Jessica Binda-Rischow,  
Supervisor of Facilities and Physical Plant 
Council Rock School District 
30 North Chancellor Street 
Newtown, PA 18940 
Email: jbinda-rischow@crsd.org 
 
Re:  Council Rock School District 
 2025 Capital Improvement Projects – Bid Recommendations 
 
 
Dear Jessica, 
 
As you are aware, bids were opened on Wednesday, February 26, 2025, for the 2025 Summer 
Projects. As a result of heavy bid competition, the District realized an overall total project savings 
of $231,151, including the recommended value-added alternates and the $500,000 CES/JCI 
Project. In addition, the projects include allowances and contingencies totaling over $500,000. 
This bid savings can be reallocated towards future capital improvement projects.  
 
We have prepared the following bid recommendations and the attached bid tabulations for your 
consideration. 
 
CHA recommends awarding the contracts to the following contractors for each respective project: 
 

 
Project 

No. 

 
Project 

 
Bid 

Results 
26FEB25 

Original 
Budget 

15NOV24 

 
Delta 

 
Contractor  

(Apparent Low 
Bidder) 

99728 CES Façade and 
Fencing Modifications 

$110,950 $169,000 ($58,050) Walter Brucker Company 
(No Bid Alternates) 

99729 CRHS North 
Natatorium 
Dehumidification and 
UV Control Panel 
Relocation 

$1,318,000 $865,000 $453,000 Myco Mechanical, Inc. 
(No Bid Alternates) 
*Increased bid scope 

99731 CRHS North Tennis 
Court Restoration 

$879,766 $1,000,000 ($120,234) Harris Blacktopping, Inc. 
(Alternate Nos. 1, 2, and 
3) 

99732 CRHS North Cast-In-
Place Structural 
Repairs 

$323,483 $175,000 $148,483 Armor Masonry 
Restoration 
(Alternate No. 1) 

99733 CRHS North and 
South Painting and 
Flooring  
Replacement 

$335,728 $300,000 $35,728 Walter Brucker & 
Company 
(No Bid Alternates) 
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99734 CRHS North and 
Holland MS Gym Floor 
Replacement 

$935,109 $896,000 $39,109 Miller Sports 
Construction 
(No Bid Alternates) 
*Assumes DK Const. Bid 
to be non-responsive – 
CRSD solicitor to confirm 

99735 MM Welch ES and 
Holland ES Asphalt 
Paving Restoration 

$590,513 $1,300,000 ($709,487) B. Blair Corporation 
(Alternate Nos. 1 and 4) 

  
Total Bids Including 
Value Added 
Alternates 

 
$4,493,549 

 
$4,705,000 

 
($211,451) 

Total Savings to be 
reallocated to future 
CIP Projects 

 30% Fees and Cont. *$891,800 $1,411,500 ($519,700) *Reduced $348,065 
 Total Project Costs $5,385,349 $6,116,500 ($731,151) Reallocate to CES/JCI 
 CRSD CES/JCI 

contract 
$500,000 ----- ----- Not a CHA Project 

 Total Project Costs 
including CES/JCI 

$5,885,349 $6,116,500 ($231,151) To be reallocated to 
future summer projects 

      
 BASED ON $6M 

Budget 
$5,885,349 $6,000,000 ($114,651)  

 
In addition, we have attached the Updated Project Costs for each project as follows: 
 

• Attachment 1 – Churchville ES Façade and Fencing Modifications 
• Attachment 2 – CRHS North Natatorium Dehumidification 
• Attachment 3 – CRHS North Tennis Court Restoration 
• Attachment 4 – CRHS North Cast-In-Place Concrete Repairs 
• Attachment 5 – CRHS North and South Painting and Flooring Replacement 
• Attachment 6 – CRHS North and Holland MS Gym Floor Replacement 
• Attachment 7 – M.M. Welch ES and Holland ES Paving Restoration 

 
Finally, we have attached the Bid Tabulations for each of the above noted projects.  
 
Please consider approving this recommendation at the March 20, 2025, Board Meeting. This will 
allow CHA to issue the Intent to Award notices, collect bonds and insurance for CHA/District 
review, and proceed with the final execution of contracts, ensuring that we remain on schedule in 
alignment with the bid documents. 
 
We will attend the March 6, 2025, Facilities Committee Meeting to assist the administration in 
presenting the projects and bid results.  
 
We have evaluated the bid submission packages for compliance with the project specifications, 
and currently, do not have any reason to believe that the above-listed contractors are not in 
compliance. We do not anticipate any issues regarding their qualifications or abilities, as we have 
worked with them on many projects. 
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Please feel free to contact us with any questions that you may have. 
 
Sincerely, 
CHA Consulting 
  
 
 
Doug Taylor, Associate AIA 
Senior Project and Section Manager 
 
Attachments: Updated Project Costs 
  Bid Tabulation Sheets 
 
Copy to: Anthony Rapp, Director of Business Administration 
 
V:\Projects\BPA132\Proj1\006-299 - Schools\283 - Council Rock SD\_28300 CRSD Retainer\2025 Summer Projects (CIP) 



ATTACHMENT 1
Original Budget

$219,700

Item No Description
Unit 

Description
No. of Units Cost per Unit Total Estimated Cost

Construction Cost
(Based on Actual Bids)

Comments

345
Add laminated aluminum panels to existing corrugated 
metal façade includoing flashings and trims

LS 1 $169,000 $169,000 $110,950
Walter Brucker and Company

344 Modifiy chain link fencing at mechanical corral
Included 

above
1 $0 $0 TBD

Total Estimated Construction Cost $169,000 $110,950 ($58,050)

SC-1 CHA Design Phase Fee $2,500 + 7% $14,330 $10,267 Per Retainer Services Agreement
SC-2 CHA Construction Administration Phase Fee Included Included Per Retainer Services Agreement

SC-3 Permitting, Bidding, Design and Const. Contingencies $36,370 $27,000 Reduced
Total Soft Costs $50,700 $37,267

$219,700 $148,217 ($71,484)Total Estimated Project Cost

Council Rock School District - Churchville ES Façade Modification and Fencing
Budget Update

26-Feb-25

Soft Costs

Construction Costs



COUNCIL ROCK SCHOOL DISTRICT
    CHURCHVILLE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
FACADE SITE FENCING MODIFICATIONS

 
 CHA PROJECT NO.  099728

BID TABULATION  
FEBRUARY 26, 2025

*
 Jones Masonry Restoration 

Corp. 
 TE Construction Services, 

LLC 
 Walter Brucker & Company, 

Inc. 

BASE BID 144,000.00$                                182,950.00$                                110,950.00$                                
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ATTACHMENT 2
Original Budget

$1,124,500

Item No Description
Unit 

Description
No. of Units Cost per Unit Total Estimated Cost

Construction Cost
(Based on Actual Bids)

Comments

41
Replace (2) dehumidification units serving Natatorium 
including duct work modifications, roof/wall openings, and 
insulation

LS 1 $865,000 $865,000 $1,318,000
Myco Mechanical, Inc.

63 Relocate UV filtration control to less corrosive location
Included 

above
1 $0 $0 Included 

Added Scope:
1. Dunnage modifications
2. Chloramine exhaust system
3. Curb removal and structural modifications
4. Work being performed in 2026

LS 1 $0 $0 Included 

Total Estimated Construction Cost $865,000 $1,318,000

SC-1 CHA Design Phase Fee  7% $60,550 $92,260 Per Retainer Services Agreement
SC-2 CHA Construction Administration Phase Fee Included $0 Per Retainer Services Agreement
SC-3 Permitting, Bidding, Design and Const. Contingencies $198,950 $100,000 Reduced 

Total Soft Costs $259,500 $192,260

$1,124,500 $1,510,260 $385,760Total Estimated Project Cost

Council Rock School District - CRHS North Natatorium Dehumidification and UV Lighting
Budget Update

26-Feb-25

Soft Costs

Construction Costs



COUNCIL ROCK SCHOOL DISTRICT
HIGH SCHOOL NORTH

NATATORIUM DEHUMIDIFICATION AND UV REPLACEMENT
     

 CHA PROJECT NO. 099729  

BID TABULATION  
FEBRUARY 26, 2025

*
 Gaudelli Bros Inc.  Hirschberg Mechanical  JBM Mechanical, Inc.  LGB Mechanical, Inc.  Myco Mechanical Inc.  Worth & Company, Inc. 

BASE BID 1,382,000.00$                        1,433,000.00$                        1,422,000.00$                        1,795,000.00$                        1,318,000.00$                        1,410,000.00$                        
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ATTACHMENT 3
Original Budget

$1,300,000

Item No Description Unit 
Description

No. of Units Cost per Unit Total Estimated Cost Construction Cost
(Based on Actual Bids)

Comments

3 Mill, overlay and new all-weather surface at 10 tennis 
courts - add pickle ball lines to 4 courts

LS 1 $1,000,000 $1,000,000 $514,000 Harris Blacktopping Inc.

Alternate Bid No. 1 - Replace all chain link fencing LS 1 TBD TBD $223,756
Alternate Bid No. 2 - Add chain link fencing to fully enclose 
all tennis courts

LS 1 TBD TBD $37,010

Alternate Bid No. 3 - Restore sportcourt to all-weather 
surface to match other court surfaces

LS 1 TBD TBD $105,000

Total Estimated Construction Cost $1,000,000 $879,766

SC-1 CHA Design Phase Fee  7% $70,000 $61,584 Per Retainer Services Agreement
SC-2 CHA Construction Administration Phase Fee Included $0 Per Retainer Services Agreement

SC-3 Permitting, Bidding, Design and Const. Contingencies $230,000 $130,000 Reduced

Total Soft Costs $300,000 $191,584

$1,300,000 $1,071,350 ($228,650)Total Estimated Project Cost

Council Rock School District - CRHS North Tennis Court Restoration
Budget Update

26-Feb-25

Soft Costs

Construction Costs



COUNCIL ROCK SCHOOL DISTRICT
HIGH SCHOOL NORTH

TENNIS COURT RESURFACING
     

 CHA PROJECT NO. 099731  

BID TABULATION  
FEBRUARY 26, 2025

*

 Associated Paving  Barker & Barker 
Paving* 

 Harris Blacktopping 
Inc.  Meco Constructors  Schlouch Inc. 

BASE BID 580,300.00$                  499,975.00$                  514,000.00$                  593,038.35$                  634,462.80$                  

*

ALTERNATE #1-ADDED to the Base Bid amount to replace the perimeter 
chain link fencing system including gates, posts, footings, and accessories to 
match existing configuration/gate locations/etc, and as detailed on the 
drawings. 

257,600.00$                  143,975.00$                  223,756.00$                  241,507.44$                  250,833.82$                  

*

ALTERNATE #2-ADDED to the Base Bid amount to add a gate to the 
chain link fencing system including gates, posts, footings, and accessories to 
match existing configuration/gate locations/etc, and as detailed on the 
drawings. 

40,375.00$                    31,800.00$                    37,010.00$                    61,215.84$                    40,930.65$                    

*

ALTERNATE #3-ADDED for the removal of the ‘sport court tile system’ 
at the basketball/street hockey court located to the north of the tennis courts, 
perform the mill and overlay, and provide new all-weather surface typical to 
tennis courts with game lines and graphics to match existing.

90,200.00$                    74,000.00$                    105,000.00$                  65,000.73$                    100,575.85$                  

TOTAL 968,475.00$                  749,750.00$                  879,766.00$                  960,762.36$                  1,026,803.12$               

* Withdraw bid
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ATTACHMENT 4
Original Budget

$227,500

Item No Description Unit 
Description

No. of Units Cost per Unit Total Estimated Cost Construction Cost
(Based on Actual Bids)

Comments

73 Repair spalled cast-in-place concrete ndow surround/roof 
beam adjacent to main entrance/interior stair tower

LS 1 $175,000 $175,000 $297,918
Armor Masonry Restoration, Inc. 

Alternate Bid No. 1 - Replace existing curtainwall system 
with new aluminum curtainwall system to match new

LS 1 TBD TBD $25,565

Added Scope:
1. Interior concrete repairs
2. Need to replace window
3. Aluminum Coping/Roofing Repairs
Total Estimated Construction Cost $175,000 $323,483

SC-1 CHA Design Phase Fee $2,500 +  7% $14,750 $25,144 Per Retainer Services Agreement
SC-2 CHA Construction Administration Phase Fee Included $0 Per Retainer Services Agreement

SC-3 Permitting, Bidding, Design and Const. Contingencies $37,750 $37,750

Total Soft Costs $52,500 $62,894

$227,500 $386,377 $158,877Total Estimated Project Cost

Council Rock School District - CRHS North CIP Concrete Repairs
Budget Update

26-Feb-25

Soft Costs

Construction Costs



COUNCIL ROCK SCHOOL DISTRICT
HIGH SCHOOL NORTH

STRUCTURAL REPAIRS WINDOW REPLACEMENT
     

 CHA PROJECT NO.  099732 

BID TABULATION  
FEBRUARY 26, 2025

*
 Armor Masonry Restoration, 

Inc.  DK Construction Services  Jones Masonry Restoration 
Corp. 

 TE Construction Services, 
LLC  Walter Brucker & Company 

BASE BID 297,918.00$                                 329,000.00$                                 689,000.00$                                 155,750.00$                                 497,100.00$                                 

*
ALTERNATE #1-ADDED / DEDUCTED from the Base 
Bid amount to replace the existing curtainwall system and 
glazing with new curtainwall system and glazing.

25,565.00$                                   148,000.00$                                 No Change 295,000.00$                                 1.00$                                            

TOTAL 323,483.00$                                 477,000.00$                                 689,000.00$                                 450,750.00$                                 497,101.00$                                 
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ATTACHMENT 5
Original Budget

$390,000

Item No Description Unit 
Description

No. of Units Cost per Unit Total Estimated Cost Construction Cost
(Based on Actual Bids)

Comments

352
353

Replace existing carpeting with carpet tile at Music Suites 
at CRHS North and CRHS South

LS 1 $300,000 $300,000 $335,728 Walter Brucker and Company

54
99

Paint Library, Cafeteria, and Nurses Suites at CRHS North 
and CRHS South

Included above 1 $0 $0 Included

Added Scope:
1. Painting of clerestory and trusses at CRHS South Library
2. Removal and reinstallation of library stacks at CRHS 
North and South
3. Striping, preparation and painting of steel railings and 
guard railings at South Cafeteria

LS 1 $0 $0 Included

Total Estimated Construction Cost $300,000 $335,728

SC-1 CHA Design Phase Fee $2,500 +  7% $23,500 $26,001 Per Retainer Services Agreement
SC-2 CHA Construction Administration Phase Fee Included $0 Per Retainer Services Agreement

SC-3 Permitting, Bidding, Design and Const. Contingencies $66,500 $25,000
Reduced

Total Soft Costs $90,000 $51,001

$390,000 $386,729 -$3,271Total Estimated Project Cost

Council Rock School District - CRHS North and South Painting and Flooring Replacement
Budget Update

26-Feb-25

Soft Costs

Construction Costs



COUNCIL ROCK SCHOOL DISTRICT
HIGH SCHOOL NORTH SOUTH

MISC. INTERIOR PAINT CARPET REPLACEMENT
     

 CHA PROJECT NO. 099733 

BID TABULATION  
FEBRUARY 26, 2025

*
 DK Construction Services  Hirschberg Mechanical  TE Construction Services, LLC  Walter Brucker & Company, Inc. 

BASE BID 339,000.00$                                       649,700.00$                                       336,500.00$                                       335,728.00$                                       
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ATTACHMENT 6
Original Budget

$1,164,800

Item No Description
Unit 

Description
No. of Units Cost per Unit Total Estimated Cost

Construction Cost
(Based on Actual Bids)

Comments

23

Removal and replacement of existing gym floor including 
adjustment of basketball backstops and operable 
partitions, removal and reinstallation of bleachers, new 
aluminum transition plates, etc. at CRHS North 

LS 1 $896,000 $896,000 $935,109

Miller Sports Construction
*Apparent Low Bid Under Review by 
Solicitor, CHA used second low bidder 

114

Removal and replacement of existing gym floor including 
adjustment of basketball backstops and operable 
partitions, removal and reinstallation of bleachers, new 
aluminum transition plates, new volleyball sleeves, etc. at 
Holland Middle School

Included 
above

1 $0 $0 Included

Added Scope:
1. Added game lines at CRHS North, added graphics and 
enlarged center court logo
2. Added 4 volleyball sleeves, added graphics and enlarged 
center logo at HMS

LS 1 $0 $0 TBD

Total Estimated Construction Cost $896,000 $935,109

SC-1 CHA Design Phase Fee 7% $62,720 $65,458 Per Retainer Services Agreement
SC-2 CHA Construction Administration Phase Fee Included $0 Per Retainer Services Agreement

SC-3 Permitting, Bidding, Design and Const. Contingencies $206,080 $100,000
Reduced

Total Soft Costs $268,800 $165,458

$1,164,800 $1,100,567 -$64,233Total Estimated Project Cost

Council Rock School District - CRHS North and Holland MS Gym Floor Replacement
Budget Update

26-Feb-25

Soft Costs

Construction Costs



COUNCIL ROCK SCHOOL DISTRICT
HIGH SCHOOL NORTH HOLLAND MIDDLE SCHOOL

WOOD GYM FLOOR REPLACEMENT
     

 CHA PROJECT NO. 099734  

BID TABULATION  
FEBRUARY 26, 2025

*
 DK Construction 

Services 
 Miller Sports 
Construction  Premier Builders, Inc.  TE Construction 

Services, LLC 

BASE BID 834,000.00$                   935,109.00$                   960,000.00$                   1,430,250.00$                

Apparent lowest biddder. Bid package under review.
Second lowest bidder.
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ATTACHMENT 7
Original Budget

$1,690,000

Item No Description Unit 
Description

No. of Units Cost per Unit Total Estimated Cost Construction Cost
(Based on Actual Bids)

Comments

251
217

Paving repairs including isolated areas of full depth repairs 
and complete mill and overlay of all other parking and 
drives at M.M. Welch ES and Holland ES

LS 1 $1,300,000 $1,300,000 $533,913
B. Blair Corporation

220
207

Select concrete sidewalk replacement, curb replacement, 
inlet repairs, etc. at M.M. Welch ES and Holland ES

Included 
above

1 $0 $0 Included

Alternate No. 1 - Covert stone parking to asphalt at area 
adjacent to the YMCA

LS 1 TBD TBD $35,600

Alternate No. 2 - Mill and overlay hard play at HES LS 1 TBD TBD Not recommended

Alternate No. 3 - Mill and overlay hard play at MMWES LS 1 TBD TBD Not recommended

Alternate No. 4 - Replace cable barricades with swing gates 
at three locations at MMWES

LS 1 TBD TBD $21,000

Total Estimated Construction Cost $1,300,000 $590,513

SC-1 CHA Design Phase Fee 7% $91,000 $41,336 Per Retainer Services Agreement
SC-2 CHA Construction Administration Phase Fee Included $0 Per Retainer Services Agreement

SC-3 Permitting, Bidding, Design and Const. Contingencies $299,000 $150,000
Reduced

Total Soft Costs $390,000 $191,336

$1,690,000 $781,849 -$908,151Total Estimated Project Cost

Council Rock School District - M.M. Welch ES and Holland ES Paving Restoration 
Budget Update

26-Feb-25

Soft Costs

Construction Costs



COUNCIL ROCK SCHOOL DISTRICT
MAUREEN M. WELCH ES HOLLAND ES

ASPHALT PAVING CONCRETE REPAIRS
     

 CHA PROJECT NO.  099735

BID TABULATION  
FEBRUARY 26, 2025

*
 Associated Paving  B. Blair Corporation  Barker & Barker 

Paving  Bray Brothers, Inc.  Harris Blacktopping, 
Inc 

 James D Morrissey, 
Inc. 

 Jones Masonry 
Restoration Corp.  Meco Constructors  T. Schiefer 

Contracting 

BASE BID 684,520.00$                   533,912.90$                   578,115.00$                   548,510.00$                   601,025.75$                   597,685.00$                  789,000.00$                  666,930.63$                  634,258.00$                  

*

ALTERNATE #1 - ADD to the Base Bid amount to 
provide the additional parking, curb modifications, 
grading, and establishment of lawn areas as identified 
on the drawing and specifications at the Holland 
Elementary School.

57,405.00$                     35,600.00$                     58,035.00$                     26,880.00$                     54,322.80$                     47,650.00$                    65,000.00$                    48,383.72$                    46,350.00$                    

ALTERNATE #2 - ADD to the Base Bid amount to 
provide the mill and overlay of the hard play area 
(playground lines and graphics to match existing) as 
shown on the drawing and specifications at the Holland 
Elementary School.

76,700.00$                     60,000.00$                     59,525.00$                     43,824.00$                     51,522.85$                     58,675.00$                    147,000.00$                  69,551.42$                    66,950.00$                    

ALTERNATE #3 - ADD to the Base Bid amount to 
provide the mill and overlay of the hard play area 
(playground lines and graphics to match existing) as 
shown on the drawing and specifications at the M.M. 
Welch Elementary School.

78,300.00$                     75,000.00$                     72,999.00$                     53,150.00$                     67,251.85$                     67,300.00$                    114,000.00$                  79,894.38$                    83,840.00$                    

*

ALTERNATE #4 -  ADD to the Base Bid amount to 
provide three (3) sets of double gates, footings, and 
accessories as shown on the drawing and specifications 
at the M.M. Welch Elementary School.

19,200.00$                     21,000.00$                     14,638.00$                     35,000.00$                     16,763.25$                     16,960.00$                    30,000.00$                    62,663.08$                    35,500.00$                    

TOTAL 761,125.00$                   590,512.90$                   650,788.00$                   610,390.00$                   672,111.80$                   662,295.00$                  884,000.00$                  777,977.43$                  716,108.00$                  
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